
T A B U L A T I O N   O F   B I D S BID DATE: February 18, 2010
AEM #09027

STADIUM PHASE 2 AEM ARCHITECTS, INC.
HAMBURG AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT 3700 Perkiomen Avenue, Reading, PA

CONTRACT #1 - GENERAL CONSTRUCTION

ALT. SERIES S200 - SYNTHETIC SANDWICH STYLE TRACK 

Alt. S100 Alt. S150 Alt. S201 Alst. S202 Alt. S203
Retaining Wall Ticket Entry by Advanced by Beynon, Conica,

Base Bid & Walkway Building Polymer, Spurtan BSS 300 Conipur SW
BV

KINSLEY CONSTRUCTION $1,419,405 -165,804.91 -182,976 +288,916.67 +280,000 +286,666.67

LANDTEK GROUP $977,500 -110,000 -80,500 +275,500 +267,250 +273,500

UHRIG CONSTRUCTION $1,394,000 -89,000 -68,000 +267,900 +259,600 +265,700

SCHLOUCH, INC. $1,279,114 -132,820 -117,793.20 +262,080 +262,080 +255,000

SUNNY ACRES SPORTS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LANDIS C. DECK $1,160,000 -110,000 -95,000 +260,025 +262,000 +260,120

CUSTOM CONTRACTING $1,270,000 -32,000 -50,000 +280,000 +272,000 +252,000

YORK EXCAVATING $1,210,000 -145,000 -60,000 +316,000 +305,000 +299,500

GATEWAY PROJ MGMT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRACE INDUSTRIES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRAND PRIX EXCAVATING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

K.C. CONSTRUCTION NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ALL AMERICAN TRACKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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T A B U L A T I O N   O F   B I D S BID DATE: February 18, 2010
AEM #09027

STADIUM PHASE 2 AEM ARCHITECTS, INC.
HAMBURG AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT 3700 Perkiomen Avenue, Reading, PA

CONTRACT #1 - GENERAL CONSTRUCTION

ALT. SERIES S220 - SYNTHETIC TURF WITH RUBBER INFILL ALT. SERIES S240 - SYNTHETIC BASEBALL INFIELD

Alt. S221 Alt. S222 Alt. S223 Alt. S224 Alt. S241 Alt. S242 Alt. S243 Alt. S244
by Sportexe, by A-Turf, by Astroturf, by Field Turf, by Sportexe by A-Turf, by Astroturf, by Field Turf

Omnigrass, 41 Premier-R XPE 42 Classic Momentum 41 Premier-RS XPE 42 Classic
40/2.0 XP 40/2.0 XP

KINSLEY CONSTRUCTION +441,708.89 +462,827.78 +479,395.56 +509,127.78 +105,162.32 +122,051.21 +117,883.43 +124,648.90

LANDTEK GROUP NO BID NO BID +490,000 +399,500 NO BID NO BID +140,000 +113,000

UHRIG CONSTRUCTION NO BID +429,000 NO BID +471,900 NO BID +76,700 NO BID +82,000

SCHLOUCH, INC. +413,440 +433,210 +448,715 +465,970 +73,400 +89,200 +85,300 +91,630

SUNNY ACRES SPORTS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

LANDIS C. DECK +397,538 +416,456 431,456 +458,215 +113,432 +128,632 +125,881 +130,969

CUSTOM CONTRACTING +429,000 +450,000 +465,000 +483,000 +95,000 +112,000 +70,000 +76,000

YORK EXCAVATING +473,000 +502,000 +523,000 +543,000 +163,000 +176,000 +177,000 +185,000

GATEWAY PROJ MGMT NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRACE INDUSTRIES NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRAND PRIX EXCAVATING NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

K.C. CONSTRUCTION NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID

ALL AMERICAN TRACKS NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
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T A B U L A T I O N   O F   B I D S BID DATE: February 18, 2010
AEM #09027

STADIUM PHASE 2 AEM ARCHITECTS, INC.
HAMBURG AREA SCHOOL DISTRICT 3700 Perkiomen Avenue, Reading, PA

CONTRACT #1 - GENERAL CONSTRUCTION

Alt. S260 Alt. S300 Alt. S400
Pole Vault Baseball Scoreboards
Equipment Field Fence

KINSLEY CONSTRUCTION +29,946.52 +13,027.50 +69,333.33

LANDTEK GROUP +26,000 +16,400 +24,500

UHRIG CONSTRUCTION +26,700 +14,700 +19,200

SCHLOUCH, INC. +5,700 -12,000 +26,400

SUNNY ACRES SPORTS NO BID NO BID NO BID

LANDIS C. DECK +34,000 -13,900 +6,800

CUSTOM CONTRACTING +2,500 +17,000 +20,000

YORK EXCAVATING +30,000 +5,000 +46,000

GATEWAY PROJ MGMT NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRACE INDUSTRIES NO BID NO BID NO BID

GRAND PRIX EXCAVATING NO BID NO BID NO BID

K.C. CONSTRUCTION NO BID NO BID NO BID

ALL AMERICAN TRACKS NO BID NO BID NO BID
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